
2025
Meeting – Creating Keeping Safe Pack and other Easy Reads 

needed



Being Safe Staying Safe 

You Said, We Did

• You said you want to make a toolkit for Staying Safe based on the survey 
feedback  

• We talked about what to include

• You said we should include – fire alarms, first aid kits, cold calls/scams, 
wallet sized information would be good

• You said why we need safe places and it would help vulnerable people in 
the community to know where they can go



Being Safe Staying Safe 

You Said, We Did

• You said the Farnborough group have made a survey for Safe Places

• You said you would like Easy Reads from experts in Fire Service and Police 
to share on the website to help people access their services

• You said people should know what to do in a difficult situation

• We talked about funding for Safe Places and we invited someone from 
Minstead who has been involved in the scheme to come to the next 
meeting



2025
Meeting – Safe Places 



Being Safe Staying Safe 

You Said, We Did

• Jay attended to talk about Safe Places and give ideas 

• You said this was helpful and gave some help for next steps

• We will look at postcodes to see if this might help with areas

• Postcodes in Hampshire - postcode-info.co.uk

• You talked about funding and places you might ask for funding

https://www.postcode-info.co.uk/hampshire-postcodes-370.html


Being Safe Staying Safe 

You Said, We Did

• You worked on a letter to send about Safe Places

• You looked at an Easy Read for Staying Safe

• You gave feedback on what should be in the pack



2025
Meeting – Safe Places 



Being Safe Staying Safe 

You Said, We Did

• Everyone introduced themselves 

• You said what is important about Safe Places

• We agreed R would read a script at the Partnership meeting to tell 
everyone about Safe Places 

• We talked about what to ask at the Partnership

• You said you would ask who would like to be involved and ask of any 
places they would like, to be a Safe Place



Being Safe Staying Safe 

You Said, We Did

• You said there are fights in Eastleigh in the evenings

• You said one of your friends has recently told you they are homeless
• We spoke about this after the meeting

• Andrew said the scheme has worked best where there have been good 
partnerships built 

• Andrew can provide resources and support with networking 

• You said found a New self-advocate called Neil at the Pallant, Portsmouth



Being Safe Staying Safe 

You Said, We Did

• Andrew said he is happy to support with Safe Places 

• You said there is a stall at the Stables 28 June

• J will chair the next meeting and would like to talk about an update on 
Safe Places after the Partnership meeting 

• New Forest now has a Safe Places scheme with the Community Safety 
Partnership and they are looking for people to join the scheme



2025
Meeting – Safe Places 



Being Safe Staying Safe 

You Said, We Did

• Everyone introduced themselves

• You spoke about feedback from the Partnership on Safe Places

• You said you would like Nicki from the New Forest to tell us more about 
her Safe Places in her area

• We said we will link with Nicki about this 

• Tanya gave feedback about the issues raised at the New Milton Mencap 
meeting she attended with Trish 



Being Safe Staying Safe 

You Said, We Did

• You spoke about your experience of using Disabled toilets

• You said sometimes the keypad is the wrong height if someone is in a 
wheelchair

• You said sometimes they are double locked and can be too small inside

• We said we will tell Nicki about these issues and invite her to a future 
meeting 

• Tanya said she would like to go to the group again 



Being Safe Staying Safe 

You Said, We Did

• We asked you to look out for Safe Places stickers and feedback where 
you found them in the next meeting

• We said the Learning Disability week this year we will focus on Being 
Safe

• We said we will use the Being Safe Pack and promote that along with  
photos 

• You said next time you would like to look at the Easy Reads and also to 
talk about LD week 



2025
Meeting – LD week and Easy Reads 



Being Safe Staying Safe 

You Said, We Did

• Everyone introduced themselves and Ieuan from the Fire Service joined 
us today

• We cannot find a police representative who can attend regularly

• We asked if anyone has looked for ‘Safe Places’ stickers, James said him 
and Katie are doing this together, you said Southampton and Gosport 
have lots

• Ieuan asked what fire service can do for you and any improvements and 
what you would like to hear about from the Fire Service



Being Safe Staying Safe 

You Said, We Did

• You asked how fire fighters deal with it, it must be hard – Ieuan said 
there is support for people 

• You asked about jobs and were told reasonable adjustments can be 
made to encourage more applicants to the Fire Service

• There is a multi-agency fire safety framework that Ieuan can tell us more 
about next time

• Nila suggested Emma come along to talk to you about Safeguarding 
toolkit



Being Safe Staying Safe 

You Said, We Did

• We talked about LD week and that we need the ‘Being Safe’ Easy Read 
ready in time for sharing in this week

• Nila asked if info could be added to the Mate Crime Easy Read on 
Cuckooing and will send the document on this from the Social Care 
Practice Manual

• You asked how many people with LD have been rescued from fires, 
Ieuan will see if this data is recorded 



2025
Meeting – LD week and Easy Reads 



Being Safe Staying Safe 

You Said, We Did
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